ANNEXURE A

FINANCE: IN YEAR MONITORING AND REPORTING: THIRD QUARTER: 2020/2021 FINANCIAL YEAR (MONTH ENDING 31 MARCH

2021) (6/1/1(2020/21))

1. QUARTER THREE SDBIP 31 MARCH 2021

MUNICIPAL FINANCIAL MANAGEMENT AND VIABILITY

Summary of First quarter SDBIP (Jan, Feb and Marc 2021) Municipal financial management and viability

Key Performance Indicators Performance Remarks Quarter Target Actual achieved
Number of Household earning less than per month with access to free ]
Approved 2021/22 Budget by 31 May 2021 Draft annual budget to be Council tabled Draft annual budget
Achieved tabled on or before 31 g
2021 on the 31 March 2021
March 2021
Number of section 71 reports submitted to Treasury within 10 days after 3 3
the end of the month by 31 March 2021 Achieved
Percentage Expenditure on MIG by 30 September 2020 Achieved 75% 76%
Percentage Expenditure of Financial Management Grant by 31 December 7504 76%
2020 Achieved
Percentage Expenditure on INEP Grant by 31 March 2021 Not Achieved 75% 0%
Percentage of Tenders processed within 90 days by 31 March 2021 )
(From closing date in the advert) Not Achieved 95% 92%
Percentage of Electricity Distribution loss by 31 March 2021 Achieved 10% 204
Percentage of Invoices Paid within 30 days of receipt by 31 March 2021 Achieved 100% 100%
Percentage of Billed revenue collected per month during 2020/21 ( 31 Achieved 85% 84%

March 2021 Financial Year

Figure 1: Summary of 3" quarter ending 31 March 2021 SDBIP




2. ANALYSIS OF SECOND QUARTER SDBIP KEY PERFOMANCE INDICATORS AND
ACHIEVMENT ENDING 31 MARCH 2021.

1. Number of Household earning less than per month with access to free electricity

e The target was for the municipality to register 7890 by the end of Third quarter. The
municipality achieved the target by registering 4449 by the end of March 2021.

2. Approved annual budget 2021/2022 by 31 May 2021

The target was for budget and treasury to prepare and submit draft annual budget to council
to be tabled during March 2021.The council tabled draft annual budget on the 31 March
2021.The target was achieved.

3. Number of section 71 reports submitted to Treasury within 10 days after the end of the
month by 31 March 2021

e The target was for the municipality to submit section 71 reports to provincial and
national treasury within ten working days after the end of each month. The target
was achieved and three section 71 reports were submitted to both national and
provincial Treasury during third quarter.

4. Percentage Expenditure of Financial Management Grant by 31 March 2021.
e The target was to spend 75% of financial management grant by 31 March 2021 .The

municipality achieved this target by spending 76% of the budget.

5. Percentage of Tenders processed within 90 days by 31 March 2021 (From closing date in the
advert). The target was not achieved and only 92% was achieved. The reasons for the delay
in processing of bids.

6. Percentage of Electricity Distribution loss by 31 March 2021.
The target for the municipality was to achieve less than 10% on distribution loss. The

distribution loss for second quarter was 2% .The target was achieved.

7. Percentage of invoice processed within 30 days from the date of receipts of the invoice. The
target was achieved and 100% of the invoice was paid within 30 days from the date of
receipt of the invoice.

8. Percentage of Billed revenue collected per month during 2020/21 as at 31 March 2021
Financial Year.

e The target was for the municipality to achieved 85% collection rate at the end of the
quarter ending 31 March 2021. The target was achieved by 84%



3. ANALYSIS FROM REPORTS FROM INCOME AND EXPENDITURE QUARTER
ONE ENDING 31 MARCH 2021
SUMMARY': INCOME AND EXPENDITURE REPORT PERFOMANCE

The actual operational income for third quarter is R 245 467 million and actual to date is R 873
053 million. The operational expenditure for the same period is R 233 293 million and actual to date
is R 734 823 million.

Summary overall budgeted and actual expenditure

Types of Budget Adjusted Budget Budget Spent Variance % Spent
Operational R 1 040 billion R 735 million R 305 million 71%
Capital R 294 million R 83 million R 211 million 28%
Total R 1.334 billion R 818 million R 516 million 61%

Summary Budget and overall current expenditure

The municipality adjusted operational budget of R 1 040 billion and adjusted capital budget of R 294
million and the amount of R 735 million and R 83 million was spent respectively. This represents
71% spending on operational budget as well as 28% spending on capital budget. Overall spending is
R 818 million against the approved budget of R 1.334 billion and this represent 61% spending of the
budget




4. APPROVED CONDITIONAL GRANT AS AT 31 MARCH 2021

Details of Grants allocated ,Grants Performance as at 31 MARCH 2021

Budget Year 2020121
Actual | Actual

y Adjusted | Grants Received | , Actual Received Q3 . Actual Q1 |Actual Q2 Expenditure |Actual Q3 Expenditure| % Spenton | BUDGETVS |  Full Year
P Budget | YTDROO R“;',;;‘;m R“;',;;‘;Qz Re | R | RO RO received | ACTUALY% |  Forecas
APPROVED CONDITIONAL GRANT

Funded by

MG 98,962 98,962 42000 32,700 1268 | 74907 25,968 25,530 24090 T6%  76% 98962
INEP 10,340 10,340 8,000 2340 1,325 - - 135 % 7% 10340
FMG 1,700 1700 1,700 1293 476 163 B T6%  T6% 1,700
EPWP 2210 200 58| 102 680 1,703 568 568 80  To% 7% 2210
Total Grants 112,872 112872 44268 4722 17,68 85,201 21012 26,860 31,356 76% T6% 112872




Municipal infrastructure Grant (MIG)

The actual amount received for the third quarter is R 14 268 million and to date is R 98 562
million and actual expenditure for the third quarter is R 23 409 million and to date is R 74 907
million that represent 76% of expenditure against approved allocation of R 98 562 million.

Integrated National Electricity Programme (INEP)

The actual amount received for the third quarter is R 2 340 million and to date R 10 340
million and actual expenditure for the third quarter is R 7 325 million that represents 71% of
expenditure against approved allocation of R 10 340 million.

Financial Management Grant (FMG)

The actual amount received for the third quarter is zero and to date is R 1 700 million and
actual expenditure for the third quarter is R 54 thousands and to date is R 1 293 million that
represents 76% against the approved allocation of R 1 700 million.

Expanded Public Works Programme (EPWP)

The actual amount received for the third quarter is R 680 thousands and to date is R 2 270

million and actual expenditure for the third quarter is R 568 thousands and to date is R 1 703
million that represent 75% against the approved allocation of R 2 270 million.



5. SUMMARY OF PERFORMANCE OF INCOME AND EXPENDITURE 31 MARCH 2021

Description Budget Year 2020/21
Rthousands Adjusted Budget Thirdl-Qu'arter Q1 Sept Q2 DEC Q3MARCH | Third Quarter Actual |  YTD Variance Y.TD Blgzsgmlet ﬁiﬁ:::::: Fultea
Projections variance y i Forecast
0 0
Revenue By Source
Property rates BTAO000| 65075000 | 2180608800  208BK700| 2256634143 06,286,876.43 0612643 1% 7% 101% B7.441,000.00
Service charges - electricty revenue BNGK000| 7315513000 G6O2400|  100.179412%5| 674690361 234,398,756 61 75637339 7% 4% 8% 364.206,840.00
Service charges - refuse revenue 41330000 870997500 3EN00|  32A4N00| 31884004 9 6714504 0148404 | 10% 3% 1% 1161330000
Rental of facilies and equipment BO40| 20078300 1001495 89,9000 6436543 234703 41308| 21% 6% 8% 31,044.00
Interest earned - externalinvestments | 44034800 33025860 1,198 465.00 102804215 5325380 275903095 4356505 -20% 63% B4% 440344800
Interest eamed - outstanding deblors | 22.66098400| 1701746800 BSBIN0|  6YTANN| 828960310 2173279310 ATIBI510| 2 6% 128% 22,689.984.00
Fings, penalties and forfeits 404499000 363374400 172,604.00 956,560.00 29361645 1,424 80045 2208,04355| -155% 2% W 4844,992.00
Licences and permits 451939200 33695400 1,071,610.00 B63,546.0 1,330,631.37 326578737 ABTE083| 4 2% %% 451939200
Transfers and subsidies S05030400( 3969902800 74015700 200183000 13547384800 510,604,365.00 H3T04137.00 | 22% 6% 0% | 52932030400
Other revenue 325000800 2795750600 16650900 14485350| 648090850 2259603100 S4TE00| 24 B1% B1% 37.50,006.00
Total Revenue 1,066,650,312.00 | 799,987,734.00| 277,434,577.00| 350,451,561.60 | 245467,231.73 §73,033,370.33 73,065,636.33 | 9% §2% 109% | 1,066,650,312.00




Budget Year 2020121

i | —— | | m YT0 Actual Actlfalvs ne

Adjusted Budget| 01 Sept G20EC | QBMARCH | Third Quarter Actual | YTDVariance | | BudgetiBudget | Project
Projections Variance | i Forecast

0 0

Expenditure By Source

Employes related coss ORTAN00| 2082 |  GISTO0|  To38R100 80017893 219.340250.35 21367101 1% Te'h 0% | 28950743100
Remunerafion of councilors 04003200) 28075240 6,411,678.00 630192200 64885%.22 19,602,19.22 J20530078] -4l % B 04003200
Debt impairment 4,134752001 34501 0640 11616001 1981741300 146930301 31,045,064 295999 6% % 413475200
Depreciaon & asset mpaiment MIBTE0| W60\ NB2UN|  RATBB| RGN 016971179 HBMI| W M| 0 | 0087600
Fnance charges 8810.00800| 661148100 4457 88000 445788000 210860000 33 o b 8815,908.00
Bulk purchases N0820600 256161200 GTAT6TO00 852161001 486971990 226664009 L8010610( -10% b7 0% 0820160
Othermaterials MEG60( L0 4G000|  SNEIMN0| 747G 1088 LM % |6 B% | 85160
Contracted ervces USH00|  BESME0| BN BIBO|  BEIGUD B0 65071428 WA | & % | 00
Other expendure 0020001 GTa0262| 2089412001 7 3N8MAN0 17093780 65.274.43340 L5788 3 13 o 9,000,29t.00
Total Expenditre 1,040,033,06200 76002401150 861020471 262,859697.29| 2332930463 IAR006888 | AS2010067) % | T | W% | 104003308200




6. SIGNIFICANT VARIANCES ANALYSIS OF REVENUE AND EXPENDITURE PERFORMANCE

1. Revenue
1.1.1 Licenses and Permits
e The actual licenses and permits collected for the third quarter is R 1 330 million and to date is R 3 266 million compared with the R 3 389
million projections which results to under collected by 3%. This is a direct income which is collected as and when customer requires the service.

Expenditure

2.1.1 Debt Impairment
This is non- cash item and expenditure for the third quarter is R 30 053 million and to date is R 16 937 million compared to the projection of R 25
567 million.

2.1. 2 Depreciation & asset impairment
This is non- cash item and expenditure for the second quarter is R 30 053 million and to date is R 93 190 million compared to the projection of R 90
066 million.



7. CAPITAL EXPENDITURE.

The Actual Capital expenditure for the third quarter 2020 is R 19 267 million and to date is R 63 795 million which result to 28% spending against the
adjusted approved budget of R 293 591 million.

CODE DEPARTMENT BUDGET EXPENDITURE VARIANCE PERCEN-
TAGE
SC Technical Services R 216,067,538.29 R 47,071,730.52
22%
R 168,995,807.77
SC Community Services
16%
R 12,610,000.00 2,050,000.00 10,560,000.00
SC Budget and Treasury
64%
R 49,929,000.00 31,860,186.08 18,068,813.92
SC Corporate Services
p 18%
R 11,269,000.00 2,062,000.00 9,207,000.00
SC Regional Offices
0%
R 3,715,000.00 R 18 400 3,715,000.00
TOTAL
R 293,590,538.29 R 83,062,316.60 R 210,528,221.69 28%




Analysis of Capital budget expending per department
Department of Budget and Treasury office

The actual expenditure for the third quarter is R 3 877 million and to date is R 31 860 million compared with the projection of R 37 446 million which result
to under spending by 15%.The expenditure incurred represent 64% of approved budget of R 49 929 million for 2020/21 financial year. .

Technical Services Department

The actual expenditure for the third quarter is R 15 217 million and to date is R 47 072 million compared with the projection of R 162 050 million which
result to under spending by 71%.The expenditure incurred for the represent 22% of approved budget of R 216 067 million for 2020/2021 financial year.

Department of Community services
The actual expenditure for the third quarter is R 172 thousands and to date is R 2 050 million compared with the projection of R 9457 million which result
to under spending by 78%.The expenditure incurred represent 16% of approved budget of R12 610 million for 2020/21 financial year.

Department of Corporate Services

The actual expenditure for the third quarter is zero and to date is R 2 062 million compared with the projection of R 8 451 million which result to under
spending by 76%. The expenditure incurred represent 18% of approved budget of R 11 269 million for 2020/21 financial year.

Regional Offices
The actual expenditure for the third quarter is zero and to date is R 18 thousands compared with the projection of R 2 786 million which result to under
spending by 99%.The expenditure incurred represent 0% of approved budget of R 3 715 million for 2020/21 financial year.




DEBTO

LIM344 Makhado-Supporting Table SC3 Monthly Budget Statement- Aged Debtors _M09 March 2021

Description BUDGET 2020/2021

Debtors Age Analysis By Income Source

Trade and Other Receivables from Exchange Transactions - Electricity 16,398 4,864 3,336 2,056 2,395 6,590 10,123 45,762 21,164
Receivables from Non-exchange Transactions - Property Rates 6,864 3,877 3,502 3,329 3,202 15,298 81,552 135,763 123,314
Receivables from Exchange Transactions - Waste Management 910 619 525 500 533 2,619 15,685 21,391 19,338
Interest on Arrear Debtor Accounts 2,302 2,237 2,164 2,083 2,011 10,812 56,113 77,722 71,020
Other 3,107 1,995 1,814 1,384 1,086 12,377 31,333 53,095 46,179
Total By Income Source 29,581 13,592 11,341 9,352 9,227 47,696 194,806 | 333,733 | 281,015
Debtors Age Analysis By Customer Group
Organs of State 1,120 2,213 2,202 1,913 2,063 6,575 25,644 41,730 36,195
Commercial 14,520 4,761 2,366 1,932 1,669 15,766 22,867 63,881 42,234
Households 7,429 4,269 4,349 3,581 3,639 16,915 108,506 166,827 152,573
Other 6,512 2,349 2,424 1,926 1,857 8,440 37,789 61,295 50,013
Total By Customer Group 29,581 13,592 11,341 9,352 9,228 47,696 194,806 | 333,733 | 281,015

RS AGE ANALYSIS The amount outstanding from debtors as at 31 MARCH 2021 is R 322 733 000.00



Debt Impairment

D Debtors Age Analysis By Customer Group

Debtors Age Analysis By Customer Group

Customer Group Total Debt  per | Impairment Provided | Net Debt per
Customer Group - Customer Group
R000 R000 R000

Organs of State R 49551 (R 42 840) R 6711

Commercials R 64 254 (R 55552) R 8702

Households R155734 (R134 643) R21 091

Others R 64 194 (R 55 500) R 8694

Total By Customer | R 333733 (R288 535) R45 198

Group

Summary of Debt Impairment Narration

Allowance for debt impairment for the Month of March 2021 (being the third quarter of the 2020/ 2021 Financial Yez

The Total Consumer Debtors as at the 31° of March 2021 equals R333 733
The Net Debt Collectible equals R45 198

COLLECTION REPORT
e The non-existent of electricity in R293 Towns such as Dzanani, Waterval, Vleifontein, excluding Tshikota sti

e Vhembe District Municipality still owes R64m as at the 31% of March 2021.

o Distribution loss for the month ending 31 March 2021 amounted to 2%.

e The overall Distribution Losses for the third quarter, in the 2020 /2021 Financial Year = 2%

e The municipality achieved 107% collection rate in March 2021.

e The overall Collection Rate for the third quarter = 84%

e The 84% collection rate was achieved because of the COVID - 19 pandemic
challenge, which resulted in the loss of Jobs and the fact that the month of

February is short.




COLLECTION REPORT FOR THE THIRD QUARTER OF 2020/ 2021

MONTHS COLLECTION RATE
January - 2021 80%

February - 2021 65%

March - 2021 107%

Total average 84%

CHALLENGES THAT IMPACT ON COLLECTION

. The non-existent of electricity in R293 Towns such as Dzanani, Waterval, Vleifontein, excluding Tshikota.
o Illegal connections

o Government entities who are not paying the Municipality e.g Rural development and public works

7. SCM PROCESS
COMPETITIVE BIDDING PROCESSES ACTIVITY

ACTIVITY Bids Evaluate | Adjudicate | Awarde | BBB Re- Cancelle

Advertise d d d -EE | Advertise d
d d

Balance 15 - - - - - -

B/F

15t Quarter 28 14 14 09 05

2" Quarter 17 29 29 25 04

3" Quarter 35 17 17 13 04

Total to 95 60 60 47 13

Date

ANNEXUR A B C D E F F

E

All requests for adverts were processed. At the end of March 2021, the following 35 bids
were not awarded:

NO BID NO DESCRIPTION CLOSING COMMENTS
DATE
1 Re-advertisement supply and In evaluation
delivery of aggregate sand sands
410f 2020 | ihin )l(/lakhggo %/Iunicipality fora | 05 October 2020
period of three years at 12:00
2 Supply,delivery and Installation of In evaluation
42 of 2020 | High Mast lights at Makhado
Landfill Site 23-Nov-20
3 43 of 2020 | Supply and delivery of skip bins 16-Nov-20 In evaluation
4 panel of service providers for In evaluation
38 0f 2020 | supply and delivery of refuse | 05 October 2020
plastics at 12:00
Provision of asset management in i
> 25 of 2020 | compliance with MFMAg and GRAP | 21 August 2020 In evaluation
compliance for a period of three (03) | at 12:00




electrical Contractors for

at 12:00pm

NO BID NO DESCRIPTION CLOSING COMMENTS
DATE
years
6 Appointment of a panel of In evaluation
contractors for emergency and
64 of 2020 preventative mainter?ancgfor a
period of three years 29-Jan-21
7 Appointment of a panel of engineers In evaluation
65 of 2020 | for electrical projects for a period of
three years 29-Jan-21
8 01 of 2021 | Re-advertisement : Supply 01 February In Evaluation
and Delivery of Gooseneck 2021 at
Trailer for Makhado local 12:00pm
municipality
9 22 February In evaluation
06/2021 Re-advertisement: supply and | 2021 at 12:00pm
delivery of spares for repairs
and maintenance for Makhado
local municipality fleet for the
period of two (02) years
10 07/2021 Re-advertisement: supply and | 22 February In evaluation
delivery of cleaning material | 2021 at 12:00pm
for the period of three years
11 08/2021 Re-advertisement: supply and | 22 February In evaluation
delivery of hardware material | 2021 at 12:00pm
for the period of three years
12 09/2021 Re-advertisement: supply and | 22 February In evaluation
delivery of paints for the 2021 at 12:00pm
period of three years
13 10/2021 22 February In evaluation
Re-advertisement: repairs of 2021 at 12:00pm
small equipment for the
period of the two (02) years
14 26 February In evaluation
14/2021 Refurbishment of tourism 2021 at 12:00pm
information centre
15 15/2021 Microsoft 365  Business | 01 March 2021 | In evaluation
Standard Licenses (45 Users) | at 12:00pm
And  Microsoft 365 E3
Licenses (50 Users) For A
Period Of Twelve (12)
Months
16 16/2021 Mime cast cyber resilience | 01 March 2021 | In evaluation
foundation plan, upgrade from | at 12:00pm
G1 to M2R For 350 users And
licensing for the Period Of
Three (03) Years
17 17/2021 Appointment of panel of 01 March 2021 | In evaluation




NO BID NO DESCRIPTION CLOSING COMMENTS
DATE
electrification of villages for
the period of three (03)
years
18 18/2021 Rehabilitation and resealing | 01 March 2021 | In evaluation
of roads, emergency at 12:00pm
potholes patching within
Makhado local municipality
for the period three years as
and when required basis.
19 19/2021 Upgrade of server 19 February In evaluation
infrastructure hardware 2021 at 12:00pm
20 20/2021 Supply And Deliver 19 February In evaluation
Operating System for Server | 2021 at 12:00pm
21 21/2021 Renew Microsoft office 365 | 01 March 2021 | In evaluation
apps for business license for | at 12:00pm
the period three(03) years
22 22 of 2021 15 March 2021 | In evaluation
Panel of service providers to at 12:00pm
provide a service of grass
cutting , litter picking in
Makhado municipality parks,
empty stand and open spaces
as and when required basis for
the period of three (03) years.
23 23 of Supply and delivery of 40 x 01 March 2021 | In evaluation
2021 Skip bins for Makhado local at 12:00pm
municipality.
24 24 of 2021 | Supply, delivery and 01 March 2021 | In evaluation
commissioning of server at 12:00pm
cabinet with built-in air-
conditioning and controls.
25 25 of 2021 | Refurbishment of the existing | 19 March 2021 | In evaluation
cattle pound structure at at 12:00pm
Makhado municipality animal
pound.
26 26 of Panel of service providers for | 15 March 2021 | In evaluation
2021 Supply and delivery of at 12:00pm
stationery and cartridges/toner
for the period three (03) years
27 27 of 2021 | Appointment of an electrical | 12 March 2021 | In evaluation
contractor for upgrading of | at 12:00pm
Shefeera line
28 28 of 2021 | Appointment of an electrical | 12 March 2021 | In evaluation

contractor ~ for  upgrading
Levubu-2 line poles and
insulators replacement:

at 12:00pm




NO BID NO DESCRIPTION CLOSING COMMENTS
DATE

29 29 of 2021 | Supply, deliver 5 x CTVT | 12 March 2021 | In evaluation
outdoor units 22 KV for | at12:00pm
Makhado Local Municpality.

30 30 of 2021 | Refurbishment of Eltivillas 12 March 2021 | In evaluation
Swimming pool at 12:00pm

31 31 0f 2021 | Re-Advertisement : Provision | 09 April 2021 at | On advert
of Fleet Tracking System for | 12:00pm
the period of three (03) years

32 32 0f 2021 | Upgrading of Dzanani Vehicle | 23 March 2021 | In evaluation
testing station from Grade “B” | at 12:00pm
to “A” and calibration.

33 33 0f 2021 | Supply, delivery of material 23 March 2021 | In evaluation
and construct a concrete at 12:00pm
palisade fence at Eltivillas
Swimming Pool.

34 34 of Refurbishment of Dzanani 09 April 2021 at | On advert

2021 taxi rank ablutions blocks 12:00pm
35 35 of Appointment of an electrical | 09 April 2021 at | On advert
2021 contractor for replacement of | 12:00pm

double structure poles and
insulators at levubu 1 line.

FORMAL WRITTEN QUOTATION AS AT 31MARCH 2021

ACTIVITY | Quotations Advertised Quotations Quotations Awarded
Evaluated

15t Quarter 09 16 16

2" Quarter | 38 08 08

39 Quarter | 19 10 10

STATUS OF RECONCILIATIONS AS AT 31 MARCH 2021

Bank reconciliations is up to date

Grant Reconciliation is up to date

Investment Reconciliations is up to date

Assets Reconciliation is up to date

Petty Cash reconciliation is up to date

Retention reconciliation is up to date

Inventory Reconciliation is up to date

Debtors Reconciliations is up to date

Salary Reconciliation is up to date

Vat Reconciliation is done up to Month of February 2021




7. A CASH FLOW FORECAST

This statement indicates the financial position as at 31 MARCH 2021 is R 328 467 555.15 .The
municipality continue to keep a favorable balance on the monthly basis and this cash flow statement
reflect positive balance of R 328 467 555.15 at the end second quarter 31 March 2021.

Primary Account R 328 467 555.15
Closing balance as at 31 March 2021 R 328 467
555.15






